
Chris Parry

From: Sowerby, Andrew R. <Andrew.R.Sowerby@cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk>
Sent: 28 August 2015 10:27
To: Chris Parry
Subject: RE: 2048 - Recycling Wales Ltd

Chris, the current charge for a low risk surrender is set at £2,532. If you need anything else to help with this
surrender process please let me know.
You probably have it already but NRWs up to date charging scheme can be found at the following link. Page 35 for
low risk surrender.
http://naturalresources.wales/media/3557/environmental permitting charge scheme guidance 2015 16.pdf

Andrew

Andrew Sowerby
Environment Officer
Natural Resources Wales / Cyfoeth Naturiol Cymru 
Tel / Ffôn: 0300 065 3806 

E- mail / E-bost:  
andrew.r.sowerby@naturalresourceswales.gov.uk / andrew.r.sowerby@cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk

Website / Gwefan:
www.naturalresourceswales.gov.uk / www.cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk

Ein diben yw sicrhau bod adnoddau naturiol Cymru yn cael eu cynnal, eu gwella a’u defnyddio yn gynaliadwy, yn awr 
ac yn y dyfodol.

Our purpose is to ensure that the natural resources of Wales are sustainably maintained, enhanced and used, now 
and in the future.

From: Chris Parry [mailto:chris@oaktree environmental.co.uk]
Sent: 28 August 2015 10:19
To: Sowerby, Andrew R. <Andrew.R.Sowerby@cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk>
Subject: RE: 2048 Recycling Wales Ltd

Thanks Andrew and no worries, just to confirm the fee would be £2,540?

No problem with the CAR Forms, we’d just normally view them prior to submitting a surrender application, I’m not
sure it’s worth paying £60 to obtain.

I’d hope to have the surrender application submitted next week or the following week at the latest.

Regards
Chris

Chris Parry BSc (Hons) | Senior Consultant

RIF-2048-C
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From: Sowerby, Andrew R. [mailto:Andrew.R.Sowerby@cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk]
Sent: 28 August 2015 10:10 
To: Chris Parry 
Subject: RE: 2048 - Recycling Wales Ltd

Hi Chris,

Sorry I didn’t get back to you yesterday.

We believe that the site could apply for a low risk surrender and therefore pay the lower fee.

With regards to the CAR forms etc these are things we would review ourselves when the low risk surrender was
applied for. Should you wish to have copies you would have to make a Freedom of Information Request or come in
to have a look at the public register. Due to the age of the site there are likely to be a lot of inspection reports to
send to you.
I am not sure what information you require for the EP History so if you could let me know I can have a look into it.

Regards
Andrew

Andrew Sowerby
Environment Officer
Natural Resources Wales / Cyfoeth Naturiol Cymru 
Tel / Ffôn: 0300 065 3806 

E- mail / E-bost:  
andrew.r.sowerby@naturalresourceswales.gov.uk / andrew.r.sowerby@cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk

Website / Gwefan:
www.naturalresourceswales.gov.uk / www.cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk

Ein diben yw sicrhau bod adnoddau naturiol Cymru yn cael eu cynnal, eu gwella a’u defnyddio yn gynaliadwy, yn awr 
ac yn y dyfodol.

Our purpose is to ensure that the natural resources of Wales are sustainably maintained, enhanced and used, now 
and in the future.

From: Chris Parry [mailto:chris@oaktree environmental.co.uk]
Sent: 28 August 2015 09:42
To: Sowerby, Andrew R. <Andrew.R.Sowerby@cyfoethnaturiolcymru.gov.uk>
Subject: 2048 Recycling Wales Ltd

Hi Andrew,

Further to our conversation on Wednesday, did you manage to find out if the site would qualify for a low risk
surrender and pay the lower fee?



I was also wondering if you’re able to send me a copy of the site’s relevant EP history and CAR Forms which would
enable me to produce a Surrender Report Supporting Document?

I hope the above is clear, but please don’t hesitate to contact me if you have any queries.

Regards
Chris

Chris Parry BSc (Hons) | Senior Consultant
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